ESM Solutions - Sourcing - Line Item Bid

Event ID B25002 Event Name Forklift

Section Name Standard Line Item Pricing

Section Attachments

SupplierTotal CostNotesAtlas Toyota Material Handling48,885.77Chaves Brothers Management LLC40,674.00Crown Equipment Corp61,958.55Elizarov Consulting Group, LLC41,150.00OCTANE Forklifts, Inc.41,959.00Technology International inc.36,200.00No bid on exVoss Equipment49,827.80				
Chaves Brothers Management LLC Crown Equipment Corp Elizarov Consulting Group, LLC OCTANE Forklifts, Inc. Technology International inc. 40,674.00 41,958.55 41,150.00 41,959.00 36,200.00 No bid on ex	Supplier	Total Cost	Note	S
Crown Equipment Corp 61,958.55 Elizarov Consulting Group, LLC 41,150.00 OCTANE Forklifts, Inc. 41,959.00 Technology International inc. 36,200.00 No bid on ex	Atlas Toyota Materia	l Handling	48,885.77	
Elizarov Consulting Group, LLC 41,150.00 OCTANE Forklifts, Inc. 41,959.00 Technology International inc. 36,200.00 No bid on ex	Chaves Brothers Manage	ement LLC	40,674.00	
OCTANE Forklifts, Inc. 41,959.00 Technology International inc. 36,200.00 No bid on ex	Crown Equip	ment Corp	61,958.55	
Technology International inc. 36,200.00 No bid on ex	Elizarov Consulting (Group, LLC	41,150.00	
	OCTANE For	rklifts, Inc.	41,959.00	
Voss Equipment 49,827.80	Technology Interna	itional inc.	36,200.00 No bi	d on exte
	Voss E	quipment	49,827.80	
WOLTER INC 38,096.00	W	OLTER INC	38,096.00	

Supplier Name	Response Notes	Response Attachment	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Quantity (Re Unit	Bid Price (Rec Extende	ed Bid Price Not	tes SupplierNotes	Attachmer NoBid
Atlas Toyota Material Hand	lir \$48,086.77	ι certification of bidder form signed, Ν	FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	48,086.77 \$	48,086.77	unit comes standard w	ith live GPS a No
Atlas Toyota Material Handlir \$48,086.778 hipping and installation includer tile certification of bidder form signed, NADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED		ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	799.00 \$	799.00	Toyota offers 3 extende	ed warranty No	
Chaves Brothers Managemo	en New Viper FY25		FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	38,674.00 \$	38,674.00	New Viper FY25	No
Chaves Brothers Managemo	en New Viper FY25		ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	2,000.00 \$	2,000.00		No
Crown Equipment Corp	Total Delivered Price of the forklift \$60,	7 Forklift Quote	FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	60,779.05 \$	60,779.05	Total Delviered Price	No
Crown Equipment Corp	Total Delivered Price of the forklift \$60,	7 Forklift Quote	ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	1,179.50 \$	1,179.50	48 months/8,000 hours	s powertrain No
Elizarov Consulting Group, I	LC	MFG SPEC SHEET	FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	41,150.00 \$	41,150.00	CPQYD25-KU1H New H	leli Pneumat No
Elizarov Consulting Group, I	LC	MFG SPEC SHEET	ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	- \$	-	Warranties: → 2 Year /	2,000 Hour l No
OCTANE Forklifts, Inc.	The extended warranty is optional - we	chose this one because it is the most of	FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	40,259.00 \$	40,259.00		No
OCTANE Forklifts, Inc.	The extended warranty is optional - we	chose this one because it is the most o	ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	1,700.00 \$	1,700.00	36 month/6,000 hour F	Powertrain W No
Technology International in	c.	tii equipment proposal, CERT FORM	FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	36,200.00 \$	36,200.00		No
Technology International in	C.	tii equipment proposal, CERT FORM	ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1				Yes
Voss Equipment			FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	48,837.80 \$	48,837.80		No
Voss Equipment			ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	990.00 \$	990.00		No
WOLTER INC	JOLIET JUNIOR COLLEGE FORKLIFT BID N	FORKLIFT BID B25002 BOBCAT	FORKLIFT AS SPECIFIED WITHIN THE JJC BID DOCUMENT	1 \$	37,001.00 \$	37,001.00		No
WOLTER INC	JOLIET JUNIOR COLLEGE FORKLIFT BID N	FORKLIFT BID B25002 BOBCAT	ADDITIONAL COST TO ADD AN EXTENDED WARRANTY	1 \$	1,095.00 \$	1,095.00		No