

Joliet Junior College												
B18033 - Audio Visual Equipment												
March 12, 2019 10:00 AM												
			<b>CDW-G</b>		<b>Audio Visual Systems</b>		<b>American Education Supply</b>		<b>Adorama</b>		<b>School Specialty</b>	
ITEM	QNTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
1	30	Epson powerlite 980	\$615.00	\$18,450.00		\$0.00	\$899.99	\$26,999.70	\$834.99	\$25,049.70	\$647.39	\$19,421.70
2	7	Epson powerlite 990	\$775.00	\$5,425.00		\$0.00	\$1,221.11	\$8,547.77	\$999.99	\$6,999.93	\$952.27	\$6,665.89
3	7	Epson powerlite 2155w	\$1,585.00	\$11,095.00		\$0.00	\$1,876.54	\$13,135.78	\$599.99	\$4,199.93	\$1,257.15	\$8,800.05
4	3	Epson powerlite 535w	\$805.00	\$2,415.00		\$0.00	\$1,187.90	\$3,563.70	\$966.60	\$2,899.80	\$940.07	\$2,820.21
5	6	LG49" 49SE3KD-B	\$710.00	\$4,260.00		\$0.00	\$867.72	\$5,206.32	\$677.90	\$4,067.40	No bid	
6	6	LG55" 55SE3KD-B	\$845.00	\$5,070.00		\$0.00	\$1,152.32	\$6,913.92	\$858.80	\$5,152.80	No bid	
7	1	LG65" 65SE3KD-B	\$1,469.00	\$1,469.00		\$0.00	\$1,960.05	\$1,960.05	\$1,499.99	\$1,499.99	No bid	
		<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>\$48,184.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$66,327.24</b>		<b>\$49,869.55</b>		<b>\$37,707.85</b>
Certification of contract bidder			Y		Y		N		Y		Y	
Notes:					Disqualified: Did not complete pricing section of bid document.						See bid document for substitute product information (Dukane)	

Joliet Junior College												
B18033 - Audio Visual Equipment												
March 12, 2019 10:00 AM												
			<b>Midwest Computer Products</b>		<b>2M Solutions</b>		<b>B&amp;H Foto &amp; Electronics</b>		<b>Signal Perfection</b>		<b>Taza Supplies</b>	
ITEM	QNTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
1	30	Epson powerlite 980	\$592.85	\$17,785.50	\$893.00	\$26,790.00	\$771.00	\$23,130.00	\$597.89	\$17,936.70	\$897.75	\$26,932.50
2	7	Epson powerlite 990	\$758.16	\$5,307.12	\$1,075.00	\$7,525.00	\$925.00	\$6,475.00	\$764.21	\$5,349.47	\$1,198.13	\$8,386.91
3	7	Epson powerlite 2155w	\$1,253.06	\$8,771.42	\$1,642.00	\$11,494.00	\$1,415.00	\$9,905.00	No bid		\$1,761.75	\$12,332.25
4	3	Epson powerlite 535w	\$779.60	\$2,338.80	\$1,045.00	\$3,135.00	\$899.00	\$2,697.00	\$786.32	\$2,358.96	\$1,136.25	\$3,408.75
5	6	LG49" 49SE3KD-B	\$678.35	\$4,070.10	\$660.00	\$3,960.00	\$668.00	\$4,008.00	\$775.00	\$4,650.00	\$787.50	\$4,725.00
6	6	LG55" 55SE3KD-B	\$898.96	\$5,393.76	\$895.00	\$5,370.00	\$1,125.00	\$5,625.00	\$1,118.48	\$6,710.88	\$1,361.25	\$8,167.50
7	1	LG65" 65SE3KD-B	\$1,522.68	\$1,522.68	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$1,700.00	\$10,200.00	\$1,597.83	\$1,597.83	\$3,105.00	\$3,104.95
		<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>\$45,189.38</b>		<b>\$59,774.00</b>		<b>\$62,040.00</b>		<b>\$38,603.84</b>		<b>\$67,057.86</b>
Certification of contract bidder			Y		Y		Y		Y		Y	
Notes:												

Joliet Junior College										
B18033 - Audio Visual Equipment										
March 12, 2019 10:00 AM										
			<b>Media Resources</b>		<b>Howard Technology Solutions</b>		<b>Camcor</b>		<b>COTG</b>	
ITEM	QNTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST	UNIT COST	TOTAL COST
1	30	Epson powerlite 980	\$622.65	\$18,679.50	\$602.00	\$18,060.00	\$716.00	\$21,480.00	\$734.35	\$22,030.50
2	7	Epson powerlite 990	\$795.95	\$5,571.65	\$785.00	\$5,495.00	\$916.00	\$6,412.00	\$911.23	\$6,378.61
3	7	Epson powerlite 2155w	\$1,225.35	\$8,577.45	\$1,599.00	\$11,193.00	\$1,443.00	\$10,101.00	\$959.72	\$7,418.04
4	3	Epson powerlite 535w	\$819.00	\$2,457.00	\$807.00	\$2,421.00	\$943.00	\$2,829.00	\$934.16	\$2,802.48
5	6	LG49" 49SE3KD-B	\$644.80	\$3,868.80	\$695.00	\$4,170.00	\$625.00	\$3,750.00	\$753.63	\$4,521.78
6	6	LG55" 55SE3KD-B	\$855.92	\$5,135.52	\$900.00	\$5,400.00	\$876.00	\$5,256.00	\$903.40	\$5,420.40
7	1	LG65" 65SE3KD-B	\$1,456.00	\$1,456.00	\$1,624.00	\$1,624.00	\$1,499.00	\$1,499.00	\$1,564.91	\$1,564.91
		<b>TOTAL</b>		<b>\$45,752.92</b>		<b>\$48,363.00</b>		<b>\$51,328.00</b>		<b>\$50,136.72</b>
Certification of contract bidder				Y		Y		Y		Y
Notes:									2155W has been discontinued, so 2142W has been substituted as a comparable product.	