
Joliet Junior College

Quote for Printing & Mailing of the Annual Appeal

November 7, 2016 @ 10:00AM

DESCRIPTION SIZE/STOCK QNTY TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST

           30,000 
$7,107.43 $4,514.00 $14,421.00 $7,883.00 $5,775.00 $5,832.75 $5,902.00 no bid $6,229.60 $5,860.00

           35,000 
$7,900.56 $5,067.00 $16,336.00 $8,766.00 $6,526.00 $6,614.95 $6,575.00 no bid $7,026.40 $6,680.00

           40,000 
$8,749.06 $5,620.00 $18,821.00 $9,704.00 $7,276.00 $7,348.89 $7,108.00 no bid $7,791.20 $7,500.00

           30,000 
$7,107.43 $4,571.00 $14,421.00 $7,883.00 $5,775.00 $5,832.75 $6,018.00 no bid $6,229.60 $5,860.00

           35,000 
$7,900.56 $5,132.00 $16,336.00 $8,766.00 $6,526.00 $6,614.95 $6,709.00 no bid $7,026.40 $6,680.00

           40,000 
$8,749.06 $5,700.00 $18,821.00 $9,704.00 $7,276.00 $7,348.89 $7,259.00 no bid $7,791.20 $7,500.00

           30,000 
$7,107.43 $4,745.00 $6,626.00 $8,233.00 $5,968.00 $5,982.75 $6,152.00 $6,704.00 $6,377.68 $6,010.00

           35,000 
$7,900.56 $5,326.00 $7,242.00 $9,166.00 $6,750.00 $6,789.95 $6,864.00 $7,538.00 $7,216.87 $6,855.00

           40,000 
$8,749.06 $5,907.00 $7,827.00 $10,158.00 $7,532.00 $7,548.89 $7,558.00 $8,365.00 $8,019.02 $7,700.00

           30,000 
$7,107.43 $4,812.00 $6,626.00 $8,233.00 $5,968.00 $5,982.75 $6,280.00 $7,470.00 $6,377.68 $6,010.00

           35,000 
$7,900.56 $5,406.00 $7,242.00 $9,166.00 $6,750.00 $6,789.95 $6,997.00 $8,361.00 $7,216.87 $6,855.00

           40,000 
$8,749.06 $5,987.00 $7,827.00 $10,158.00 $7,532.00 $7,548.89 $7,709.00 $9,246.00 $8,019.02 $7,700.00
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