Joliet Junior College |
Quote for Music Equipment
October 28, 2016 @ 2:00PM
WASHINGTON MUSIC HOLZBERG FULL COMPASS SAM ASH ILLINOIS B&H FOTO & VINTAGE KING SWEETWATER SOUND | WOODWIND & BRASS
CENTER COMMUNICATIONS MEGASTORE ELECTRONICS
S e s
ITEM ONTY [DESCRIPTION UNIT COST| TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST| TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST| TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST| TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST| TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST|TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST| TOTAL COSTJUNIT COST| TOTAL COST]
NATIVE INSTRUMENTS KOMPLETE  |$99.00 $792.00 $112.00 $896.00 $105.00 $840.00[$99.90 $799.20 $91.14 $729.12 $91.56 $732.48 $102.00 $816.00 NO BID
1 8|10 EDUCATIONAL LAB ADDITIONAL
SEAT
$699.00 $699.00 $839.00 $839.00 $800.00 $800.00|$749.00 $749.00 $682.74 $682.74 $685.88 $685.88 $778.00 $778.00 NO BID
2 NATIVE INSTRUMENTS KOMPLETE
10 EDUCATIONAL LAB 5-PACK
3 FOCUSRITE 2X2 USB2 AUDIO $127.50 $637.50 $199.99 $999.95 $140.00 $700.00($114.00 $570.00 $113.95 $569.75 $114.44 $572.20 $122.00 $610.00 $115.00 $575.00
INTERFACE
4 17 WAVES GOLD BUNDLE $554.50 $9,426.50 $799.00 $13,583.00 NO BID $399.00 $6,783.00 NO BID $400.00 $6,800.00 $466.00 $7,922.00 $615.00 $10,455.00
EDUCATIONAL NATIVE
5 SHURE DYNAMIC VOCAL $87.00 $261.00 $124.00 $372.00 $95.00 $285.00]$84.95 $254.85 $86.80 $260.40 $87.20 $261.60 $88.00 $264.00 $80.00 $240.00
MICROPHONE
6 RODE MULTI-PATTERN CONDENSER |$329.95 $659.90 $699.00 $1,398.00 NO BID $255.00 $510.00 $299.25 $598.50 $348.00 $696.00 $350.00 $700.00 $307.00 $614.00
MiC
7 SHURE DUAL VOICE ROSWELLITE $827.00 $1,654.00 $1,619.00 |$3,238.00 $888.00 $1,776.00]$915.00 $1,830.00 $971.25 $1,942.50 $719.89 $1,439.78 $866.00 $1,732.00 NO BID
RIBBON MIC
$31.95 $415.35 $45.00 $585.00 NO BID NO BID $36.89 $479.57 $35.00 $455.00 $45.00 $585.00 NO BID
8 13 RISING SOFTWARE AURALIA 4
ACAEMIC SITE LICENSE UPGRADE
9 13 AVID SIBELIUS 8 STAND ALONE SITE |[$114.00 $1,482.00 $119.00 $1,547.00 NO BID $99.00 $1,287.00 NO BID $112.00 $1,456.00 $108.00 $1,404.00 NO BID
LICENSE SEAT
10 AVID SIBELIUS 8 STAND ALONE SITE |$153.00 $153.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $99.00 $99.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO CHARGE NO BID
LICENSE
11 2|YAMAHA 8” ACTIVE MONITOR $227.00 $454.00 $499.00 $998.00 $223.00 $446.00{$219.00 $438.00 $262.49 $524.98 $202.96 $405.92 $221.00 $442.00 $210.00 $420.00
1 COLEMAN AUDIO 1X3 BALANCED  |$119.95 $119.95 $130.00 $130.00 $127.00 $127.00{$119.00 $119.00 NO BID $107.25 $107.25 $109.00 $109.00 NO BID
SELECTOR
FOCUSRITE 8-CHANNEL $429.00 $429.00 $599.99 $599.99 $476.00 $476.00{$375.00 $375.00 NO BID $381.49 $381.49 $388.00 $388.00 $405.00 $405.00
13 1|PREAMPLIFIER W/DIGITAL
IMPUT/OUTPUT
$39.95 $159.80 $69.95 $279.80 $45.00 $180.00|$42.00 $168.00 NO BID $39.24 $156.96 $39.00 $156.00 $37.00 $148.00
14 4|WHIRLWIND STANDARD DI BOX
$116.00 $116.00 $172.00 $172.00 $95.00 $95.00|$84.50 $84.50 NO BID $91.70 $91.70 $88.00 $88.00 NO BID
15 1|HOSA 50’ 60X2 COMPACT SNAKE
$17.75 $35.50 $17.99 $35.98 NO BID $8.50 $17.00 NO BID $9.00 $18.00 $9.00 $18.00 NO BID
16 2|RAPCOHORIZON 15’ TS =TS CABLE
$19.75 $19.75 $19.99 $19.99 NO BID $9.75 $9.75 NO BID $10.00 $10.00 $11.00 $11.00 NO BID
17 1|RAPCOHORIZON 20’ TS — TS CABLE
TOTAL| $17,514.25 $25,693.71 $5,725.00 $14,093.30 $5,787.56 $14,270.26 $15,253.00 $12,304.00
TURNAROUND TIME 21-45 DAYS ARO 24 DAYS 2 WEEKS 30 DAYS 7-14 DAYS 14 DAYS 3-4 DAYS 7-30 DAYS
WARRANTY] ATTACHED 2 YEARS PARTS & MANUFACTURERS SEE ATTACHED ITEMS 2 YEARS PARTS & FACTORY WARRANTY IS
LABOR WARRANTY INCLUDED BIDDING LABOR INCLUDED
$5K DISCOUNT IF ALL
ADD'L NOTES| ITEMS PURCHASED AS

A PACKAGE FROM THIS
VENDOR




